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Alerts

1 event
26 results matching for 'Amendments Made' during May 2005.

Number Title Date

3 of 4
www.ipmonitor.com.au

2001234670 Liposomes containing an entrapped compound in supersaturated solution 18 May 2005

2001253587 Method for a collaborative work tool environment 18 May 2005

2001294197 Aliphatic nitrogenous five-membered ring compounds 18 May 2005

2002101053 Biometric smartcard system 18 May 2005

2002222586 Process for producing lactide and process for producing polylactic acid starting with
fermented lactic acid

18 May 2005

2002245758 Novel aggrecanase molecules 18 May 2005

2002300523 Method for transmitting and receiving common information in a CDMA communication
system providing HSDPA service

18 May 2005

2002324040 Cosmetic composition and method of treating skin 18 May 2005

2002354685 Features to enhance data entry through a small data entry unit 18 May 2005

2003204278 Distributed Transaction Event Matching 18 May 2005

2003216153 Multi-substitued selective androgen receptor modulators and methods of use thereof 18 May 2005

2003224851 Pharmaceutical compositions containing water-soluble prodrugs of propofol and methods
of administering same

18 May 2005

2003228401 Depth and width adjustable display track unit with removable partitions 18 May 2005

2003252054 Packet processing engine 18 May 2005

2003255406 Hydroxyalkyl starch derivatives 18 May 2005

2003258036 METHODS AND REAGENTS RELATING TO INFLAMMATION AND APOPTOSIS 18 May 2005

2003268567 BRANCHED ALCOHOL-BASED PERSONAL CARE COMPOSITIONS 18 May 2005

2003269924 Chondropsin-class antitumor V-ATPase inhibitor compounds, compositions and methods
of use thereof

18 May 2005

2003278812 FLJ20647s AS MODIFIERS OF THE p21 PATHWAY AND METHODS OF USE 18 May 2005

2003279362 Acidic cleaning method for machine dishwashing 18 May 2005

2003287062 Temporary dental cements having reduced tooth sensitivity 18 May 2005

2003297583 Modified naturetic compounds, conjugates, and uses thereof 18 May 2005

2004202555 Electric condom ring 18 May 2005

2004240210 Systems and methods using cryptography to protect secure computing environments 18 May 2005

2004902477 System and Method for Obtaining Pertinent Real-Time Survey Evidence 18 May 2005

2005201068 Protection and Finish Structure for the Hull Contour of a Boat 18 May 2005
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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